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Since 1963, at Kroll Energy GmbH, we have 
been committed to combining excellent 
engineering expertise and production 
power to craft customized solutions with 
regard to the requirements of our clients.
  
Whether it‘s heating, cooling, or dehumidi-
fying, we o� er high-quality products tailo-
red to your specifi c needs. We place parti-
cular emphasis on our mobile air-to-air heat 
pump technology, which has revolutionized 
the market refl ecting our dedication to  sus-
tainability and technological progress.

Our product portfolio includes a full range 
of mobile heating, ventilation and cooling 
solutions for industrial use. In addition, our 
dehumidifi ers provide assistance on 
construction sites and with water damage.

We  meet extensive industrial requirements 
throughout the entire value chain. From 
development and production to service, all 
aspects are managed in-house or through 
our broad partner network. This ensures the 
delivery of our well-known quality, proudly 
made in Germany.
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